13 May 2024

Your request for information under the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002
(“the Act”)

Thank you for your request for information, which was received by VisitScotland on 12 April,
requesting the following information in relation to recruitment:

Chair

How many applicants were there for the Chair of VS?

Did any applicants hold a current appointment with VS [paid or unpaid] during the
recruitment process?

How long was the recruitment period for the Chair of VS?

How many stages of recruitment for the Chair of VS?

How many female and male applicants for the Chair of VS?

How many white candidates for the Chair of VS?

What were the stages of recruitment for the Chair of VS?

Please provide the shortlisting matrix for the Chair of VS.

How many interviews conducted for the Chair of VS?

10 Who were the members of the panel, to review the written application?

11. Who were the members of the interviewing panel for the Chair of VS.

12. Which recruitment firm used to conduct the search for the Chair?

13. Were any individuals notified of the vacancy and encouraged to apply, by any
member of the Board or employee of VS?
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CEO

How many applicants were there for the CEO of VS?

Did any applicants hold a current appointment with VS [paid or unpaid] during
he recruitment process?

How long was the recruitment period for the CEO of VS?

How many stages of recruitment for the CEO of VS?

How many female and male applicants for the CEO of VS?

How many white candidates for the CEO of VS?

What were the stages of recruitment for the CEO of VS?

Please provide the shortlisting matrix for the CEO of VS.

How many candidates were interviewed for the CEO of VS?

10.  Who were the members of the panel, to review the applicant's written
application?

11.  Who were the members of the interviewing panel for the CEQO of VS?

12.  Which recruitment firm used to conduct the search for the CEO ?

13.  Were any individuals notified of the vacancy and encouraged to apply, by any
member of the Board or employee of VS?
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VisitScotland’s response

Chair recruitment
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VisitScotland does not hold the information that you have requested in relation to
recruitment of our Chair. Section 17 of the Act states that where public authorities receive
requests for information that they do not hold, they must issue a notice advising that they do
not hold the requested information. This process was managed end to end by the Scottish
Government Public Appointments team and it is likely that the information you seek will be
held by them.

CEO Recruitment
1. How many applicants were there for the CEO of VS? 57 applicants

2. Did any applicants hold a current appointment with VS [paid or unpaid] during the
recruitment process? One applicant was an internal candidate - a paid employee
of VisitScotland

3. How long was the recruitment period for the CEO of VS? 26 February — 15 March
2024 was the advertising period, with announcement of successful candidate
made on 10 May 2024

4. How many stages of recruitment for the CEO of VS? Recruitment on-going at time of
FOI request. Face-to-face interviews completed and psychometric testing
completed.

5. How many female and male applicants for the CEO of VS? 9 Female, 48 Male

6. How many white candidates for the CEO of VS? 42 candidates stated their
ethnicity as White (Falling into the categories of White -
English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern Irish/British or White - Any Other White
Background).

7. What were the stages of recruitment for the CEO of VS? Face-to-face interviews,
and psychometric leadership test.

8. Please provide the shortlisting matrix for the CEO of VS. A blank short-listing form
is attached along with a candidate pack that includes person specification and
skills

9. How many candidates were interviewed for the CEO of VS? Four candidates were
interviewed.

10.Who were the members of the panel, to review the applicant's written application?
Stephen Leckie (Chair of VS), Caroline Roxburgh (Chair of ARC, Chair of
recruitment process, Board Member), Steven Walker (Board Member),
Penelope Walker (Director of Culture & Events, SG), Lynn Jack (Head of HR at
VS)

11.Who were the members of the interviewing panel for the CEO of VS? Stephen
Leckie, Caroline Roxburgh, Steven Walker, Lynn Jack

12.Which recruitment firm used to conduct the search for the CEO ? None
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13.Were any individuals notified of the vacancy and encouraged to apply, by any
member of the Board or employee of VS? No

Your right to request a review

If you wish to request a review of your application under either the Freedom of Information
(Scotland) Act 2002 or the Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004, your
request should be submitted to us in writing, or another permanent format (for example e-
mail or voice recording) to:

Mr Malcolm Roughead
Chief Executive
VisitScotland
Waverley Court

4 East Market Street
Edinburgh

EH8 8BG

Telephone: 0131 472 2201
E-mail: malcolm.roughead@yvisitscotland.com

The request for a review should be received by us within 40 days of the date of this letter.
Any request for a review should also set out, in as much detail as possible, the reasons why
you are not satisfied with our response or the manner in which we have dealt with your
application

If you are not satisfied with the result of the review, then you have the right to appeal to the
Scottish Information Commissioner.

You can contact the Scottish Information Commissioner at:

Scottish Information Commissioner
Kinburn Castle

Doubledykes Road

St Andrews

Fife

KY16 9DS

Telephone: 01334 464610
Fax: 01334 464611
Email: enquiries@itspublicknowledge.info

You also have the right to appeal to the Court of Session in Scotland on a point of law
concerning our response.
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JOB ROLE:

Chief Executive Officer

REPORTS TO:

Chair of VisitScotland

LOCATION:

Scotland - the job holder
must be based in Scotland

to deliver this role
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VisitScotland is Scotland’s national tourism
organisation. Our aim is to benefit the whole
of Scotland by growing the value of tourism
and events. Through our marketing, events,
destination development and business
support and advice, we help to create better
places for people to live, work and visit. We
are a leader in responsible tourism and are
committed to creating a sustainable tourism
destination.

We have an annual operating budget of

£47 million and a workforce of over 500 staff
spread across Scotland from the Shetland

in the north to Dumfries and Galloway in
the south.

Further information on VisitScotland can be found on
our corporate website
www.visitscotland.org.

Our new Chief Executive Officer

We are seeking to appoint an inspirational Chief Executive
Officer (CEQO) who will ensure VisitScotland continues to
play a major role in the future economic development of
Scotland by making a significant contribution towards
achieving the Scottish Government’s ambition for
tourism and events, in line with the National Strategy for
Economic Transformation (NSET) and national tourism
strategy Scotland Outlook 2030.

We are looking for someone who can provide the vision,
leadership, and strategic direction to VisitScotland and
to key stakeholders in the tourism and events industry as
well as the wider Scottish community. In this high-profile
role, you will be an ambassador for the organisation,
both in Scotland and internationally. You will develop
VisitScotland’s strategy to support the shared vision for
Scotland to be a world leader in 21st century tourism.

As a champion of responsible tourism, you will ensure
that VisitScotland’s work helps to build a destination
and visitor experience that allows tourism and events

to flourish.

The CEO is accountable to the Board of VisitScotland
and, as Accountable Officer, to the Scottish Government.
As CEO, you will ensure effective governance and inspire
our Leadership Group to work together to deliver the
organisation’s purpose, vision and mission.
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ABOUT US

Our purpose

To drive the visitor economy, growing its value to Scotland.

Our vision

Contribute to creating a vibrant and dynamic visitor economy,
creating a better place for people to live, work and visit.

Our mission

Through strategic leadership and industry partnerships, to
lead, support and contribute to a globally competitive visitor
economy, highlighting the benefits of tourism and events in
delivering the very best for our visitors, our businesses, our
people, our communities, and our environment.
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Our values

Ambitious

Through bold leadership, hard work, and imagination we are
relentless in the pursuit of new ways to inspire, engage and
bring visitors to Scotland.

People-orientated
Our people are our most valuable asset. Each one of us has a
voice and the power to make a real difference.

Collaborative

We embrace the ideas of others. Working together, across the
organisation and with our partners, allows diverse minds to
meet, driving innovation, transparency, trust, and respect.

Innovative
We regard change as an opportunity. Progression is at
our core.

Outward-looking
By looking to the world to learn and better ourselves, we will
take Scotland to new heights.

Responsible

We are committed to the development of responsible tourism
practices and a net zero sector, by protecting Scotland’s assets
now and for future generations.






02 Accountable Officer responsibilities

PRINCIPAL

« AsAccountable Officer, you will answer to the Scottish
ACCOUNTABILITIES

Government for the expenditure and receipts of VisitScotland,
ensuring the propriety and regularity of the organisation’s
finances and that these are used economically and efficiently.
With the Chair, you will ensure mechanisms are in place for the
effective corporate governance of the organisation.

«  You will ensure VisitScotland has a robust performance
framework supporting targets, performance indicators and
evaluation mechanisms to effectively measure the value
VisitScotland’s activities add to the economy of Scotland.

« You will ensure VisitScotland meets all performance targets set
by the Board and by the Scottish Government.

«  You will ensure consideration of economic, social, and
environmental sustainability informs all of the organisation’s
strategies and activities.

« You will ensure that VisitScotland has effective governance
systems and processes in place to meet the changing needs
of the organisation and the external environment. You will
ensure that these are consistently adhered to, to maintain and
enhance the organisation’s reputation and meet any regulatory
and statutory obligations..

« You will report to the Board on progress against key strategic
objectives, providing information and accountability for
organisational performance.

+  You will identify and put in place effective risk management
strategies and frameworks to measure progress against 7
our objectives.




02 Strategic Leadership

PRINCIPAL

+  You will champion the responsible growth of tourism
ACCOUNTABILITIES

and events in economic terms. You will achieve this
through developing and leading strategies that advocate
collaboration, spearhead digital innovation, promote
spend, spread, sustainability and satisfaction for visitors,
industry, and communities. By doing so, you will lead the
vision for Scotland to be one of the most economically,
environmentally, and socially sustainable destinations in
the world.

« Instrategic partnerships with key stakeholders, you will be
responsible for leading the development and delivery of
a visitor-shaped destination brand, showcasing Scotland
as a destination and visitor experience promoted through
innovative marketing, strategic partnerships and events that
will inspire visitors to come to Scotland spending time
and money.

«  You will provide leadership in developing the VisitScotland
network, including building and strengthening relationships
with key partners especially in Government, local authorities,
and the enterprise networks. You will ensure the network
is properly structured and motivated to make a strong
contribution to the economic growth of Scotland.

+  You will provide advice to the Scottish Government on
tourism matters, particularly in relation to national economic
development, and operate effectively within the wider
political picture, ensuring any potential impact on tourism is
assessed and debated. You will also contribute to the wider
policy debate on Scottish economic development, including
the promotion of Scotland.




02 H Representing VisitScotland

PRINCIPAL

« You will act as an ambassador and advocate, representing
ACCOUNTABILITIES

VisitScotland at a variety of internal and external events.

+  You will represent VisitScotland to the media both in
the UK and internationally as necessary and adopt an
ambassadorial role in positively communicating and
promoting all aspects of tourism and events in Scotland.

« AsChief Executive Officer with overall responsibility for
our workforce, you will be responsible for representing
VisitScotland to an internal audience, clearly communicating
our strategic objectives and influencing positively the level of
staff engagement and advocacy.

Workforce management

«  You will be responsible for leading a committed, dedicated,
and talented workforce, creating a high performing culture
that delivers for Scotland.

«  You will ensure VisitScotland’s values and people policies are
developed and delivered in line with Fair Work principles.

«  You will be responsible for creating a diverse, inclusive,
and progressive culture that attracts and nurtures highly
professional staff who are themselves advocates for
VisitScotland.







03 We are committed to equality of opportunity and « Confidence and assurance to regularly speak in public, this
being fair and inclusive. We therefore encourage will include working with the media.

applications from a diverse range of candidates
with the following skills and experience:

PERSON
SPECIFICATION «  Experience of engaging with a wide range of stakeholders:
excellent communication and listening skills, and a proven

ability to communicate with varying audiences.
« Anoutstanding track record of strategic leadership with

experience of leading growth and change.

« Aproven ability to establish constructive working
relationships with senior stakeholders in government,
industry, and other relevant sectors across Scotland, the UK
and internationally. —

« Agood understanding of how government and public policy-
making processes operate and an understanding of the
factors which influence policy development.

« Agood understanding of the tourism and events industry
landscape and the strategic insight and market awareness to
identify and address the challenges and opportunities of this
dynamic and exciting sector.

« Atrack record managing organisational processes, budgets,
strategic plans, and governance matters.

« Anatural ability to coach and mentor with a proven
experience of creating a positive working culture and
attaining high levels of employee engagement and
performance.

« Strong and proven networks, with the personal credibility to
represent the organisation at a high level.

111




03 Skills

PERSON

« Astrategic thinker who can make sound decisions.
SPECIFICATION

»  Excellent communication, negotiation, diplomacy and
advocacy skills.

« Rounded influencing skills with the ability to engage with
senior figures in a variety of settings.

» Aclear, effective, sensitive and consistent leader with the
ability to inspire and motivate others.

«  Strong personal credibility and humility with the ability to
collaborate and build effective relationships at all levels.
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Shortlisting form - working form for panel

Position

Chief Executive Officer

Scoring criteria

1=very poor 2=poor 3=fair 4=good 5=very good

Number

Candidate Name

Person
specification
(1-5)

Skills (1-5)

Comments

General observations about
candidate and submission
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